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Troy lives and works in Las Vegas, Sin City itself, but he wants more than glitz and fun and sex. He want a
loving long-term relationship, one based on a serious connection, a complete possession of souls, so to
speak. Only, finding the right guy isn’t that easy. Could his perfect match possibly be his good-looking long-
time—and happily straight and married—friend, John? Or what about Brett, that attractive guy he just met?
And there’s the model-perfect bad-boy-next-door who introduces himself as Remy Orleans, and yet whose
real name is Sam Miller, as Troy learns when he goes to bail his sexy neighbor out of jail. Hmm.

It takes more than mere wanting, and even more than scorching heat and blazing passion for Troy to
understand not only who he wants but who he is. Because he must, if he’s to have a hope of winning the
right guy.
Reader Advisory: This story has graphic sexual language and scenes—no closed bedroom doors (or other
rooms) here!

An adult contemporary romance from Ellora’s Cave

Publisher’s Note: This book was previously self-published and has been revised for EC.
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From reader reviews:

Mike Munguia:

The book Rent To Own can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything
you want. Exactly why must we leave a good thing like a book Rent To Own? A number of you have a
different opinion about guide. But one aim that will book can give many details for us. It is absolutely right.
Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you are able to give for each
other; you can share all of these. Book Rent To Own has simple shape however you know: it has great and
large function for you. You can appearance the enormous world by available and read a book. So it is very
wonderful.

Bridgett Killion:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the title Rent To Own suitable
to you? The particular book was written by well-known writer in this era. The book untitled Rent To Ownis
the main of several books that will everyone read now. This particular book was inspired many men and
women in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new shape that you ever know just before.
The author explained their concept in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to be aware of the core
of this guide. This book will give you a great deal of information about this world now. To help you to see
the represented of the world with this book.

Colton Fierros:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this Rent To Own publication written by
well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that may be understand by anyone who read the
book. Written in good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate
your own hunger then you still skepticism Rent To Own as good book not merely by the cover but also with
the content. This is one reserve that can break don't evaluate book by its include, so do you still needing a
different sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already alerted you so
why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Orville Hightower:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this reserve. This Rent To Own is simple to create you can
read it in the playground, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not include much space to bring
typically the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can save
the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this
book.
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