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Search has been vital to artificial intelligence from the very beginning as a core technique in problem
solving. The authors present a thorough overview of heuristic search with a balance of discussion between
theoretical analysis and efficient implementation and application to real-world problems. Current
developments in search such as pattern databases and search with efficient use of external memory and
parallel processing units on main boards and graphics cards are detailed.

Heuristic search as a problem solving tool is demonstrated in applications for puzzle solving, game playing,
constraint satisfaction and machine learning. While no previous familiarity with heuristic search is necessary
the reader should have a basic knowledge of algorithms, data structures, and calculus. Real-world case
studies and chapter ending exercises help to create a full and realized picture of how search fits into the
world of artificial intelligence and the one around us.

*Provides real-world success stories and case studies for heuristic search algorithms *Includes many AI
developments not yet covered in textbooks such as pattern databases, symbolic search, and parallel
processing units
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From reader reviews:

Kurt Gomez:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yep, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
wander, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book allowed Heuristic Search:
Theory and Applications? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time
with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have different
opinion?

Lola Paolucci:

The book Heuristic Search: Theory and Applications can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the great thing like a book Heuristic
Search: Theory and Applications? A number of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim that
will book can give many data for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with your book.
Knowledge or info that you take for that, you may give for each other; you are able to share all of these.
Book Heuristic Search: Theory and Applications has simple shape however you know: it has great and big
function for you. You can search the enormous world by available and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Gary Morrell:

Here thing why this Heuristic Search: Theory and Applications are different and trustworthy to be yours.
First of all reading a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content than it which is the content is as tasty
as food or not. Heuristic Search: Theory and Applications giving you information deeper including different
ways, you can find any book out there but there is no reserve that similar with Heuristic Search: Theory and
Applications. It gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing which
happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere
like in park your car, café, or even in your way home by train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing
the printed book maybe the form of Heuristic Search: Theory and Applications in e-book can be your
substitute.

Magdalena McKinney:

Beside this specific Heuristic Search: Theory and Applications in your phone, it could give you a way to get
more close to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh in
the oven so don't be worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have
Heuristic Search: Theory and Applications because this book offers for you readable information. Do you at
times have book but you do not get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that would not happen if
you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful
island. Techniques you still want to miss the item? Find this book along with read it from now!
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