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Understanding Equity & Trusts is the sister text to Professor Hudson’s heavyweight textbook Equity &
Trusts. It aims to give you a clear, accessible and comprehensive overview of the main themes in this
dynamic area of the law. Whether used at the beginning of studying or in the period before examinations,
this book will give you an invaluable grounding in all of the key principles of equity and the law of trusts. If
you need help with trusts law, then this is the book for you.

This book covers all of the topics that a student reader will encounter in any trusts law or equity course. The
text deals with express trusts, resulting and constructive trusts, the duties of trustees, breach of trust and
tracing, commercial uses of trusts, charities, equitable remedies and trusts of homes. Extensive updates have
been made to the text to consider several major new cases decided since the last edition, including: Supreme
Court decisions in Pitt v Holt, Jones v Kernott, and Lehman Brothers International v CRC, the continuing
debate about the proper treatment of bribery and many other cases besides.

The law of trusts is built on simple basic principles. The approach of this book is to begin with a clear
presentation of those principles before guiding the reader through the more complex issues which are the
focus of examinations in this subject. The lively text includes a large number of straightforward examples to
make the discussion of the general law more accessible.

Online support

Visit the author’s website at http://www.alastairhudson.com or the Equity & Trusts site at
http://www.routledge.com/cw/hudson in order to find podcasts of specially-recorded lectures covering the
basic principles of a whole trusts law course and much more.
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From reader reviews:

Paula Salas:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or this for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every
person has different personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that
they don't need do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Understanding Equity &
Trusts. All type of book is it possible to see on many methods. You can look for the internet resources or
other social media.

Mark Carlton:

Do you one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys that
aren't like that. This Understanding Equity & Trusts book is readable by means of you who hate the perfect
word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable looking at experience without leaving also
decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer connected with Understanding Equity & Trusts
content conveys the idea easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
information but it just different available as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Understanding Equity &
Trusts is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Franklin Crossland:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading practice give you
lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the book that
improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of guide you read, if you
want attract knowledge just go with training books but if you want feel happy read one using theme for
entertaining such as comic or novel. The actual Understanding Equity & Trusts is kind of reserve which is
giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Catharine Rosol:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you could have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. A single activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
have been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Understanding Equity & Trusts, it is
possible to enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hang type is it?
Oh can happen its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its called reading friends.
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