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Pretty Sly is Elisa Ludwig's heart-pounding sequel to Pretty Crooked and the second book in a trilogy perfect
for fans of Sarah Mlynowski, Ally Carter, or Sara Shepard.

Willa Fox was ordered to stay out of trouble by a juvenile court judge. But that was before her house was
ransacked . . . and her mother went missing. Now Willa and her sexy crush, Aidan, must violate her
probation and hit the California highway in search of her mom.

When Willa and Aidan wind up being the focus of a national manhunt, their journey becomes dangerously
criminal. Soon Willa realizes it's easier to escape the law than the truth. And everything she thought she
knew about her mom—and her life—was wrong.
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From reader reviews:

Darren Marshall:

The book Pretty Sly (Pretty Crooked Trilogy) can give more knowledge and information about everything
you want. Why then must we leave a very important thing like a book Pretty Sly (Pretty Crooked Trilogy)?
Several of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim in which book can give many info for us.
It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or facts that you
take for that, you are able to give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Pretty Sly (Pretty Crooked
Trilogy) has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and big function for you. You can appearance
the enormous world by open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

David Sayre:

Typically the book Pretty Sly (Pretty Crooked Trilogy) will bring someone to the new experience of reading
a new book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to learn,
this book very suited to you. The book Pretty Sly (Pretty Crooked Trilogy) is much recommended to you to
see. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

Patricia Sax:

Pretty Sly (Pretty Crooked Trilogy) can be one of your nice books that are good idea. Many of us
recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in
terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The copy writer giving
his/her effort to place every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Pretty Sly (Pretty Crooked
Trilogy) however doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm
resource info that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information may drawn you into brand-
new stage of crucial pondering.

Lyla Jackson:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library in order to make
summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's soul or real their
passion. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there but nothing
reading seriously. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and also can't see colorful pics on
there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we know that on this era,
many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country.
So , this Pretty Sly (Pretty Crooked Trilogy) can make you really feel more interested to read.
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