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Now in one volume, this bundle presents the first seven novels of the Meg Harris Mystery series by R.J.
Harlick. Meg Harris, an amateur sleuth who drinks a little too much and is afraid of the dark, finds herself
confronting an underside of life she would rather not know existed.

Includes:

A Cold White Fear: A Meg Harris Mystery #7 — NEW!

Cut off by a blizzard at her isolated cabin, Meg and her young friend Adjidamo are caught off-guard by the
arrival of two strange men, one wounded, which sparks a terrifying chain of events that has Meg fighting to
get herself and Adjidamo out alive.

Silver Totem of Shame: A Meg Harris Mystery #6

The murder of a young Haida carver reawakens sibling rivalries best forgotten and sends Meg Harris and her
husband, Eric Odjik, to Haida Gwaii in search of a killer.

A Green Place for Dying: A Meg Harris Mystery #5

A friend of Harris’s has been missing for over two months, but she’s not the only one.

And four more:

Arctic Blue Death: A Meg Harris Mystery #4 (Shortlisted for the Arthur Ellis Award for best crime novel)●

The River Runs Orange: A Meg Harris Mystery #3●

Red Ice for a Shroud: A Meg Harris Mystery #2●



Death&#8217s Golden Whisper: A Meg Harris Mystery #1●

“Skillfully weaves murder, greed, traditional customs, bonding, and betrayal into a gripping read.”

— Chronicle-Journal
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From reader reviews:

Douglas Dossett:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled Meg Harris Mysteries 7-Book Bundle: A Cold White Fear / Silver Totem of
Shame / A Green Place for Dying / and 4 more (A Meg Harris Mystery). Try to make book Meg Harris
Mysteries 7-Book Bundle: A Cold White Fear / Silver Totem of Shame / A Green Place for Dying / and 4
more (A Meg Harris Mystery) as your friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you feel alone
and beside regarding course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book
makes you far more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we need to make
new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Cheri Turner:

As people who live in the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or info even knowledge to
make these individuals keep up with the era which is always change and progress. Some of you maybe will
update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to a person
is you don't know what type you should start with. This Meg Harris Mysteries 7-Book Bundle: A Cold White
Fear / Silver Totem of Shame / A Green Place for Dying / and 4 more (A Meg Harris Mystery) is our
recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and wish in this
era.

Matthew Ibarra:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Meg Harris Mysteries 7-Book Bundle: A
Cold White Fear / Silver Totem of Shame / A Green Place for Dying / and 4 more (A Meg Harris Mystery)
can be the solution, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your
spare time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have
than the others?

Pearl Miller:

You will get this Meg Harris Mysteries 7-Book Bundle: A Cold White Fear / Silver Totem of Shame / A
Green Place for Dying / and 4 more (A Meg Harris Mystery) by look at the bookstore or Mall. Simply
viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve problem if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of
this guide are various. Not only through written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by means
of e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your
problem. Right now, choose your own personal ways to get more information about your publication. It is
most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose proper ways



for you.
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